
THE SURREY URBAN INDIGENOUS LEADERSHIP COMMITTEE





https://surreyindigenousleadership.ca/our-work/all-our-relations-strategy




https://surreyindigenousleadership.ca/our-work/facts-and-reports




SUILC will not mediate a
relationship with First Nation
governments for the purposes
of facilitating consultation or
accommodation with those
First Nation governments





Urban Indigenous voices in all
engagements.

Build on other engagements
done recently with the urban
Indigenous community in
Surrey.

Indigenous people should
have access to specifically
designed engagement
activities and processes to
facilitate their participation
and inclusion.

https://surreyindigenousleadership.ca/downloads/skookum-progress.pdf


Indigenous people should
have access to specifically
designed engagement
activities and processes to
facilitate their participation
and inclusion continued:

Reimburse individuals for
their contribution to your
work.

Partner with Indigenous
organizations based in Surrey.



Partner with Indigenous
organizations based in Surrey
continued:

Getting approvals for
engagement and partnerships
at appropriate levels.

Design an approach to
engagement that specifically
reflects Métis culture and
community.

Use Indigenous
methodologies for hosting
engagements and
conversations.



Design engagement activities that build community.

Ensure transparency with regard to OCAP principles.

Share control over the knowledge generated by co-developing
the report recommendations.

Hire Indigenous consultants – preferably based in Surrey.



All Our Relations.


